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USERS MANUAL

FIG 1
Take all CleanCamp fire kit accessories 
out of the travel bag. Open the safety cloth
completely and lay it on the ground shining
side down. The safety cloth provides the 
foundation for the campfire. There is a 
pillow inside the safety cloth, on which the 
wood needs to be piled.

FIG 2
In the paper bag, you will find sticks of 
birch tree for building the campfire. Build 
the frame by putting the sticks on the 
pillow as shown. Use part of the paper bag
as an accelerant.

FIG 3
Put one stick on top of the frame and light 
the fire. Add wood when necessary. Use 
birch tree sticks only (maximum length 
15 cm).

FIG 4
If needed the safety cloth can be used as 
a windbreak by lifting the edge of the cloth 
with a twine (see Fig. 4).
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FIG 5
Campfire without windbreak.

FIG 6
After the fire has burned down, ash and 
coal will be left on the pillow. Dispose of 
the ash and coal according to regulations 
(Not compostable!).

MAKE SURE THAT THE FIRE IS 
COMPLETELY EXTINGUISHED!

FIG 7
Wrap the pillow inside the safety cloth.

FIG 8
Put the CleanCamp fire kit equipment into 
its travel bag. Pillow and safety cloth are 
ready for the next use.
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